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The world-renowned fitness coach on the hit TV show The Biggest Loser presents his winning approach to
lasting weight loss by showing how to get at the root of your overeating problem, followed by a nutritionally
savvy diet and unique exercise plan.
On The Biggest Loser, Bob Harper gives contestants the practical tools and psychological insights they need
to get into the best shape of their lives. The key to his success is the emotional connection he makes with
each participant, and he brings that same spirit to Are You Ready!

Harper starts with a four-step strategy for getting at the root of negative thought patterns and destructive
behaviors, replacing both with a clear way to build self-worth and confidence. With these tools in place,
people are empowered to make real, lasting changes in their lives. In an easy-to-follow eating plan, he
provides lists of foods that are nutrient-dense and naturally low in calories, more than twenty sample menus,
and tips on eating on the run, in restaurants, and on vacation. His fitness plan is geared to making exercise an
integral part of daily life with workouts (ranging from 20 to 60 minutes) based on training techniques that
tone and strengthen, burn calories, and reshape the body.

Woven throughout Are You Ready! are true-life success stories that will keep readers engaged and motivated;
bulleted tips, tools, and coping strategies; and sidebars debunking common myths about food and fitness.
Whether your goal is losing ten pounds or a hundred, you will find Harper’s message inspiring and his
methods a proven path to finally achieving your dream of weight loss and fitness.
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From reader reviews:

David Long:

The book Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever can
give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we
leave the good thing like a book Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change
Your Life Forever? A number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or
information that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Are
You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever has simple shape
however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by open and read
a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Alysha Johnson:

Here thing why that Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life
Forever are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nevertheless it depends in
the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose
Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever giving you information deeper and different ways, you
can find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose
Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up
your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened
around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your technique home by train.
In case you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Are You Ready!: Take
Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever in e-book can be your substitute.

Lewis Wade:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a guide you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the people
do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this Are You
Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever, you could tells your
family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them
reading a publication.

Steven Young:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose



Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever guide written by well-known writer who really knows
well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written inside good
manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still
doubt Are You Ready!: Take Charge, Lose Weight, Get in Shape, and Change Your Life Forever as good
book not just by the cover but also with the content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by
its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading
through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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