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According to the author of this concise, high-level study, physicists often shy away from group theory,
perhaps because they are unsure which parts of the subject belong to the physicist and which belong to the
mathematician. However, it is possible for physicists to understand and use many techniques which have a
group theoretical basis without necessarily understanding all of group theory. This book is designed to
familiarize physicists with those techniques. Specifically, the author aims to show how the well-known
methods of angular momentum algebra can be extended to treat other Lie groups, with examples illustrating
the application of the method.
Chapters cover such topics as a simple example of isospin; the group SU3 and its application to elementary
particles; the three-dimensional harmonic oscillator; algebras of operators which change the number of
particles; permutations; bookkeeping and Young diagrams; and the groups SU4, SU6, and SU12, an
introduction to groups of higher rank. Four appendices provide additional valuable data.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Wood:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on
Physics). You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important a new book Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on Physics). You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know
everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple
factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or searching by
internet device. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go
through.

John Jones:

The book Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on Physics) can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Lie Groups for Pedestrians
(Dover Books on Physics)? Some of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will
book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge
or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book
Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on Physics) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great
and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Lidia Mejia:

Often the book Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on Physics) will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books on
Physics) is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site,
so you can easier to read the book.

Timothy Wrobel:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Lie Groups for Pedestrians (Dover Books
on Physics) e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand
by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
publishing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt Lie Groups for Pedestrians
(Dover Books on Physics) as good book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one
reserve that can break don't determine book by its protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick
this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an additional sixth
sense.
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