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Recently, scholars of Olmec visual culture have identified symbols for umbilical cords, bundles, and cave-
wombs, as well as a significant number of women portrayed on monuments and as figurines. In this
groundbreaking study, Carolyn Tate demonstrates that these subjects were part of a major emphasis on
gestational imagery in Formative Period Mesoamerica. In Reconsidering Olmec Visual Culture, she
identifies the presence of women, human embryos, and fetuses in monuments and portable objects dating
from 1400 to 400 BC and originating throughout much of Mesoamerica. This highly original study sheds
new light on the prominent roles that women and gestational beings played in Early Formative societies,
revealing female shamanic practices, the generative concepts that motivated caching and bundling, and the
expression of feminine knowledge in the 260-day cycle and related divinatory and ritual
activities.Reconsidering Olmec Visual Culture is the first study that situates the unique hollow babies of
Formative Mesoamerica within the context of prominent females and the prevalent imagery of gestation and
birth. It is also the first major art historical study of La Venta and the first to identify Mesoamerica's earliest
creation narrative. It provides a more nuanced understanding of how later societies, including Teotihuacan
and West Mexico, as well as the Maya, either rejected certain Formative Period visual forms, rituals, social
roles, and concepts or adopted and transformed them into the enduring themes of Mesoamerican symbol
systems.
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From reader reviews:

Becky Pope:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story as well
as their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or daughters,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this Reconsidering
Olmec Visual Culture (William and Bettye Nowlin Series in Art, History, and Cultur).

Brandon Inouye:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just
watching TV, or playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look
different you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read
you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a book. The book Reconsidering Olmec Visual Culture (William and
Bettye Nowlin Series in Art, History, and Cultur) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to
deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from a smart phone. The
price is not to cover but this book has high quality.

Millie Goodman:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition info. Even you love Reconsidering Olmec Visual Culture (William and
Bettye Nowlin Series in Art, History, and Cultur), you could enjoy both. It is very good combination right,
you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What?
Still don't obtain it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Haydee Todd:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, brief story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Reconsidering Olmec
Visual Culture (William and Bettye Nowlin Series in Art, History, and Cultur) that give your entertainment
preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the
method for people to know world a great deal better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't



be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to end up being
success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you are able to pick
Reconsidering Olmec Visual Culture (William and Bettye Nowlin Series in Art, History, and Cultur) become
your starter.
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