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Early modern European society took a serious view of blasphemy, and drew upon a wide range of sanctions -
including the death penalty - to punish those who cursed, swore and abused God. Whilst such attitudes may
appear draconian today, this study makes clear that in the past, blasphemy was regarded as a very real threat
to society. Based on a wealth of primary sources, including court records, theological and ecclesiastical
writings and official city statutes, Francisca Loetz explores verbal forms of blasphemy and the variety of
contexts within which it could occur. Honour conflicts, theological disputation, social and political
provocation, and religious self-questioning all proved fertile ground for accusations of blasphemy, and her
contention - that blasphemers often meant more than they said - reveals the underlying complexity of an
apparently simple concept.

This innovative approach interprets cases of verbal blasphemy as 'speech actions' that reflect broader
political, social and religious concerns. Cases in Protestant Zurich are compared with the situation in
Catholic Lucerne and related to findings in other parts of Europe (Germany, France, England, Italy) to
provide a thorough discussion of different historical approaches to blasphemy - ecclesiastical, legal,
intellectual, social, and cultural - in the Early Modern period. In so doing the book offers intriguing
suggestions about what a cultural history of religiousness could and should be.

By linking a broad overview of the issue of blasphemy, with case studies from Zurich and Lucerne, this book
provides a fascinating insight into a crucial, but often misunderstood aspect of early-modern society. The
conclusions reached not only offer a much fuller understanding of the situation in Zurich, but also have
resonance for all historians of Reformation Europe.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Beaudry:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are
reading whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who
don't like studying a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will require this Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early Modern Zurich
to a Cultural History of Religiousness (St Andrews Studies in Reformation History).

Alejandro Colon:

Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early Modern Zurich to a Cultural History of Religiousness (St
Andrews Studies in Reformation History) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We recommend
that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her
effort to set every word into delight arrangement in writing Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early
Modern Zurich to a Cultural History of Religiousness (St Andrews Studies in Reformation History) although
doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial pondering.

Kevin Masterson:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. That Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early
Modern Zurich to a Cultural History of Religiousness (St Andrews Studies in Reformation History) can give
you a lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have factor that they don't and make you
more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve
offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you to be
great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early Modern Zurich
to a Cultural History of Religiousness (St Andrews Studies in Reformation History).

Lisa Saxon:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So
you know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about



something by book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these
claims Dealings with God: From Blasphemers in Early Modern Zurich to a Cultural History of Religiousness
(St Andrews Studies in Reformation History).
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